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SWITCHBLADE™ VEHICLE
HIGH-TECH HELICOPTER BECOMES A SINISTER PURSUIT PLANE!

The VENOM SWITCHBLADE is truly
a specter of evil, a threat to every
MASK vehicle and agent. The cockpit
has an opening canopy, and copter
blades rotate at the touch of a button.
But the SWITCHBLADE has an even
more lethal form! Rotor blades fold
back, and the tail fin can be rotated to
release snap-out plane wings. Dual
laser cannons automatically pop out
of the nose section, and landing skids
become wing-mounted launchers for

zr SWITCHBLADEenergy bolts. Complete with one torpedo
missile, the VENOM SWITCHBLADE
becomes an awesome pursuit plane
headed for a showdown with MASK!
SWITCHBLADE also comes with an
articulated MILES MAYHEM figure, the
vicious evil leader of VENOM. His
special removable VIPER mask allows
you to pretend he can neutralize enemy
attacks by emitting powerful, invisible
poison.
Ages 4 and up.
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